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May 11, 2020 

Dear George Harvey CI and York Memorial CI Students, Parents, Staff, and Community: 

On February 5, 2020, the Board of Trustees approved a pupil accommodation review that 
involves George Harvey CI and York Memorial CI. A pupil accommodation review is a 
public consultation process that school boards conduct to determine the future of a group 
of schools. 

In April 2020, we informed you that the consultation meetings that are part of the pupil 
accommodation review were cancelled as a result of the shutdown due to COVID-19, and 
that new dates for the meetings will be set for when schools and administrative buildings 
have reopened. 

We are writing to you now to inform you about a change in timing for completing the pupil 
accommodation review. The original schedule we had established for its completion was 
June 2020 when staff would submit a final report to the Board of Trustees for approval of 
recommendations. Because of the shutdown, we will not be able to meet this timeline. 
Rather, the review will be extended into the fall of 2020. The review will resume when 
schools and administrative buildings have reopened. When we have new dates for the 
consultation meetings we will communicate them to you. 

To stay informed about this review, please visit the TDSB’s website at 
https://www.tdsb.on.ca/About-Us/Strategy-Planning/Search-All-Reviews?id=163. You can 
still provide your feedback on this review by filling out the survey posted on the TDSB’s 
website.  

If you have any questions, please feel free to contact me at 416-394-3911. 

Sincerely, 

 

Vicky Branco 
Superintendent of Education      

c.c. Chris Tonks, Trustee, Ward 6  
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English This document contains important information. Please take it to someone who can 
read English or to your School Office so that they can arrange for an interpreter or 
translation.  

French Le présent document contient des renseignements importants. Veuillez le montrer 
à une personne qui comprend l’anglais écrit ou au bureau de votre école qui 
prendra les dispositions requises pour engager un interprète ou un traducteur. 
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